

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Media for Oce' Copier Model #7056 & HP Plotters
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016

Archive Supplies, Inc.
 8925 Sterling St., Ste. 150
 Irving, TX 75063

Prints Charles Reprographics
 1642 South Main St.
 Milpitas, CA 95035

CAD Supplies
 13734 N IH 35
 Austin, TX 78728

GovConnection

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT			
1.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 500' Oce 4511100042, SAWS #1389	UNIT			
		PRICE	13.79	15.36	18.55
		EACH	55.16	61.44	74.20
2.	4 rolls 20# Vellum Paper 18" x 500' Oce 459020, SAWS #459020	UNIT			
		PRICE	83.86	124.77	192.00
		EACH	335.44	499.08	768.00
3.	55 rolls 20# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22815	UNIT			
		PRICE	9.69	9.01	12.075
		EACH	532.95	495.55	664.125
4.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22816	UNIT			
		PRICE	6.45	6.01	9.10
		EACH	25.80	24.04	36.40
5.	3 rolls 24# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-800, SAWS #22817	UNIT			
		PRICE	16.39	12.04	21.88
		EACH	49.17	36.12	65.64
6.	2 rolls Toner Kits for Model #7056 OCE 25001868, SAWS #25001868	UNIT			
		PRICE	220.00	223.20	249.38
		EACH	440.00	446.40	498.76
7.	5 rolls 36" x 125' matte film "mylar" (JPD4E or Equal*), SAWS #37047	UNIT			
		PRICE	118.00	139.02	172.20
		EACH	590.00	695.10	861.00
8.	1 roll 36" x 150' roll bond 20 lb. (HPC1861A), SAWS #22822	UNIT			
		PRICE	12.22	12.04	12.075
		EACH	12.22	12.04	12.075
9.	20 rolls HP Coated Bond 36" x 150' (HPC6020B), SAWS #22828	UNIT			
		PRICE	21.00	18.81	27.125
		EACH	420.00	376.20	542.50
10.	30 rolls HP Coated Paper (42" x 150') #C6559B, SAWS #22830	UNIT			
		PRICE	28.00	34.68	30.45
		EACH	840.00	1,040.40	913.50
11.	4 rolls Paper Bond 34 x 150 / 20 Oce 7056 86 500 P20HB, SAWS #43022	UNIT			
		PRICE	8.95	8.51	12.25
		EACH	35.80	34.04	49.00
12.	5 rolls Bond High Bright 36x150 20 lbs P20HB-36D, SAWS #40214	UNIT			
		PRICE	8.95	9.73	12.075
		EACH	44.75	48.65	60.375
13.	2 rolls Bond High Bright 42x150 20 lbs P20HB-42D, SAWS #40215	UNIT			
		PRICE	12.45	13.50	14.875
		EACH	24.90	27.00	29.75
14.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 42x100 Q8918A, SAWS #40216	UNIT			
		PRICE	81.00	108.72	136.12
		EACH	162.00	217.44	272.24
15.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 36x100 Q8917A, SAWS #40217	UNIT			
		PRICE	69.00	93.05	118.90
		EACH	138.00	186.10	237.80
			*		
	BASE YEAR (JANUARY 1, 2016 - DECEMBER 31, 2016) TOTAL	TOTAL	3,706.19	4,199.60	5,085.37
1.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 500' Oce 4511100042, SAWS #1389	UNIT			
		PRICE	13.79	15.36	18.55
		EACH	55.16	61.44	74.20
2.	4 rolls 20# Vellum Paper 18" x 500' Oce 459020, SAWS #459020	UNIT			
		PRICE	83.86	124.77	192.00
		EACH	335.44	499.08	768.00
3.	55 rolls 20# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22815	UNIT			
		PRICE	9.69	9.01	12.075
		EACH	532.95	495.55	664.125
4.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22816	UNIT			
		PRICE	6.45	6.01	9.10
		EACH	25.80	24.04	36.40
5.	3 rolls 24# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-800, SAWS #22817	UNIT			
		PRICE	16.39	12.04	21.88
		EACH	49.17	36.12	65.64

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Media for Océ Copier Model #7056 & HP Plotters
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016

Archive Supplies, Inc.
 8925 Sterling St., Ste. 150
 Irving, TX 75063

Prints Charles Reprographics
 1642 South Main St.
 Milpitas, CA 95035

CAD Supplies
 13734 N IH 35
 Austin, TX 78728

GovConnection

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT				
6.	2 rolls Toner Kits for Model #7056 OCE 25001868, SAWS #25001868	PRICE EACH	220.00 440.00	223.20 446.40	249.38 498.76	
7.	5 rolls 36" x 125' matte film "mylar" (JPD4E or Equal*), SAWS #37047	PRICE EACH	118.00 590.00	139.02 695.10	172.20 861.00	
8.	1 roll 36" x 150' roll bond 20 lb. (HPC1861A), SAWS #22822	PRICE EACH	12.22 12.22	12.04 12.04	12.075 12.075	
9.	20 rolls HP Coated Bond 36" x 150' (HPC6020B), SAWS #22828	PRICE EACH	21.00 420.00	18.81 376.20	27.125 542.50	
10.	30 rolls HP Coated Paper (42" x 150') #C6559B, SAWS #22830	PRICE EACH	28.00 840.00	34.68 1,040.40	30.45 913.50	
11.	4 rolls Paper Bond 34 x 150 / 20 Océ 7056 86 500 P20HB, SAWS #43022	PRICE EACH	8.95 35.80	8.51 34.04	12.25 49.00	
12.	5 rolls Bond High Bright 36x150 20 lbs P20HB-36D, SAWS #40214	PRICE EACH	8.95 44.75	9.73 48.65	12.075 60.375	
13.	2 rolls Bond High Bright 42x150 20 lbs P20HB-42D, SAWS #40215	PRICE EACH	12.45 24.90	13.50 27.00	14.875 29.75	
14.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 42x100 Q8918A, SAWS #40216	PRICE EACH	81.00 162.00	108.72 217.44	136.12 272.24	
15.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 36x100 Q8917A, SAWS #40217	PRICE EACH	69.00 138.00	93.05 186.10	118.90 237.80	
	EXTENSION 1 (JANUARY 1, 2017 - DECEMBER 31, 2017) TOTAL	TOTAL	3,706.19	4,199.60	5,085.37	
1.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 500' Océ 4511100042, SAWS #1389	PRICE EACH	13.79 55.16	15.36 61.44	18.55 74.20	
2.	4 rolls 20# Vellum Paper 18" x 500' Océ 459020, SAWS #459020	PRICE EACH	83.86 335.44	124.77 499.08	192.00 768.00	
3.	55 rolls 20# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22815	PRICE EACH	9.69 532.95	9.01 495.55	12.075 664.125	
4.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22816	PRICE EACH	6.45 25.80	6.01 24.04	9.10 36.40	
5.	3 rolls 24# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-800, SAWS #22817	PRICE EACH	16.39 49.17	12.04 36.12	21.88 65.64	
6.	2 rolls Toner Kits for Model #7056 OCE 25001868, SAWS #25001868	PRICE EACH	220.00 440.00	223.20 446.40	249.38 498.76	
7.	5 rolls 36" x 125' matte film "mylar" (JPD4E or Equal*), SAWS #37047	PRICE EACH	118.00 590.00	139.02 695.10	172.20 861.00	
8.	1 roll 36" x 150' roll bond 20 lb. (HPC1861A), SAWS #22822	PRICE EACH	12.22 12.22	12.04 12.04	12.075 12.075	
9.	20 rolls HP Coated Bond 36" x 150' (HPC6020B), SAWS #22828	PRICE EACH	21.00 420.00	18.81 376.20	27.125 542.50	
10.	30 rolls HP Coated Paper (42" x 150') #C6559B, SAWS #22830	PRICE EACH	28.00 840.00	34.68 1,040.40	30.45 913.50	

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Media for Océ Copier Model #7056 & HP Plotters
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016

Archive Supplies, Inc.
 8925 Sterling St., Ste. 150
 Irving, TX 75063

Prints Charles Reprographics
 1642 South Main St.
 Milpitas, CA 95035

CAD Supplies
 13734 N IH 35
 Austin, TX 78728

GovConnection

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT			
11.	4 rolls Paper Bond 34 x 150 / 20 Océ 7056 86 500 P20HB, SAWS #43022	PRICE EACH	8.95 35.80	8.51 34.04	12.25 49.00
12.	5 rolls Bond High Bright 36x150 20 lbs P20HB-36D, SAWS #40214	PRICE EACH	8.95 44.75	9.73 48.65	12.075 60.375
13.	2 rolls Bond High Bright 42x150 20 lbs P20HB-42D, SAWS #40215	PRICE EACH	12.45 24.90	13.50 27.00	14.875 29.75
14.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 42x100 Q8918A, SAWS #40216	PRICE EACH	81.00 162.00	108.72 217.44	136.12 272.24
15.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 36x100 Q8917A, SAWS #40217	PRICE EACH	69.00 138.00	93.05 186.10	118.90 237.80
	EXTENSION 2 (JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018) TOTAL	TOTAL	3,706.19	4,199.60	5,085.37
1.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 500' Océ 4511100042, SAWS #1389	PRICE EACH	13.79 55.16	16.13 64.52	18.55 74.20
2.	4 rolls 20# Vellum Paper 18" x 500' Océ 459020, SAWS #459020	PRICE EACH	83.86 335.44	131.01 524.04	192.00 768.00
3.	55 rolls 20# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22815	PRICE EACH	9.69 532.95	9.46 520.30	12.075 664.125
4.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22816	PRICE EACH	6.45 25.80	6.31 25.24	9.10 36.40
5.	3 rolls 24# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-800, SAWS #22817	PRICE EACH	16.39 49.17	12.64 37.92	21.88 65.64
6.	2 rolls Toner Kits for Model #7056 OCE 25001868, SAWS #25001868	PRICE EACH	220.00 440.00	223.20 446.40	249.38 498.76
7.	5 rolls 36" x 125' matte film "mylar" (JPD4E or Equal*), SAWS #37047	PRICE EACH	118.00 590.00	145.97 729.85	172.20 861.00
8.	1 roll 36" x 150' roll bond 20 lb. (HPC1861A), SAWS #22822	PRICE EACH	12.22 12.22	12.64 12.64	12.075 12.075
9.	20 rolls HP Coated Bond 36" x 150' (HPC6020B), SAWS #22828	PRICE EACH	21.00 420.00	19.75 395.00	27.125 542.50
10.	30 rolls HP Coated Paper (42" x 150') #C6559B, SAWS #22830	PRICE EACH	28.00 840.00	36.41 1,092.30	30.45 913.50
11.	4 rolls Paper Bond 34 x 150 / 20 Océ 7056 86 500 P20HB, SAWS #43022	PRICE EACH	8.95 35.80	8.94 35.76	12.25 49.00
12.	5 rolls Bond High Bright 36x150 20 lbs P20HB-36D, SAWS #40214	PRICE EACH	8.95 44.75	10.22 51.10	12.075 60.375
13.	2 rolls Bond High Bright 42x150 20 lbs P20HB-42D, SAWS #40215	PRICE EACH	12.45 24.90	14.18 28.36	14.875 29.75
14.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 42x100 Q8918A, SAWS #40216	PRICE EACH	81.00 162.00	114.16 228.32	136.12 272.24

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Media for Oce' Copier Model #7056 & HP Plotters
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016

Archive Supplies, Inc.
 8925 Sterling St., Ste. 150
 Irving, TX 75063

Prints Charles Reprographics
 1642 South Main St.
 Milpitas, CA 95035

CAD Supplies
 13734 N IH 35
 Austin, TX 78728

GovConnection

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE			
15.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 36x100 Q8917A, SAWS #40217	UNIT PRICE EACH	69.00 138.00	97.70 195.40	118.90 237.80	
			*			
	EXTENSION 3 (JANUARY 1, 2019 - DECEMBER 31, 2019) TOTAL	TOTAL	3,706.19	4,387.15	5,085.37	
1.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 500' Oce 4511100042, SAWS #1389	UNIT PRICE EACH	13.79 55.16	16.94 67.76	18.55 74.20	
2.	4 rolls 20# Vellum Paper 18" x 500' Oce 459020, SAWS #459020	UNIT PRICE EACH	83.86 335.44	137.66 550.64	192.00 768.00	
3.	55 rolls 20# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22815	UNIT PRICE EACH	9.69 532.95	9.93 546.15	12.075 664.125	
4.	4 rolls 20# Bond Paper 24" x 150' OCE 86-500, SAWS #22816	UNIT PRICE EACH	6.45 25.80	6.63 26.52	9.10 36.40	
5.	3 rolls 24# Bond Paper 36" x 150' OCE 86-800, SAWS #22817	UNIT PRICE EACH	16.39 49.17	13.27 39.81	21.88 65.64	
6.	2 rolls Toner Kits for Model #7056 OCE 25001868, SAWS #25001868	UNIT PRICE EACH	220.00 440.00	223.20 446.40	249.38 498.76	
7.	5 rolls 36" x 125' matte film "mylar" (JPD4E or Equal*), SAWS #37047	UNIT PRICE EACH	118.00 590.00	153.27 766.35	172.20 861.00	
8.	1 roll 36" x 150' roll bond 20 lb. (HPC1861A), SAWS #22822	UNIT PRICE EACH	12.22 12.22	13.27 13.27	12.075 12.075	
9.	20 rolls HP Coated Bond 36" x 150' (HPC6020B), SAWS #22828	UNIT PRICE EACH	21.00 420.00	20.74 414.80	27.125 542.50	
10.	30 rolls HP Coated Paper (42" x 150') #C6559B, SAWS #22830	UNIT PRICE EACH	28.00 840.00	38.23 1,146.90	30.45 913.50	
11.	4 rolls Paper Bond 34 x 150 / 20 Oce 7056 86 500 P20HB, SAWS #43022	UNIT PRICE EACH	8.95 35.80	9.39 37.56	12.25 49.00	
12.	5 rolls Bond High Bright 36x150 20 lbs P20HB-36D, SAWS #40214	UNIT PRICE EACH	8.95 44.75	10.73 53.65	12.075 60.375	
13.	2 rolls Bond High Bright 42x150 20 lbs P20HB-42D, SAWS #40215	UNIT PRICE EACH	12.45 24.90	14.89 29.78	14.875 29.75	
14.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 42x100 Q8918A, SAWS #40216	UNIT PRICE EACH	81.00 162.00	119.87 239.74	136.12 272.24	
15.	2 rolls Gloss HP Everyday 36x100 Q8917A, SAWS #40217	UNIT PRICE EACH	69.00 138.00	102.59 205.18	118.90 237.80	
			*			
	EXTENSION 4 (JANUARY 1, 2020 - DECEMBER 31, 2020) TOTAL	TOTAL	3,706.19	4,584.51	5,085.37	
	GRAND TOTAL BASE PERIOD, EXT 1, EXT 2, EXT 3 AND EXT 4	TOTAL	18,530.95	21,570.46	25,426.83	

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Media for Oce' Copier Model #7056 & HP Plotters
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2016)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Archive Supplies, Inc. 8925 Sterling St., Ste. 150 Irving, TX 75063	Prints Charles Reprographics 1642 South Main St. Milpitas, CA 95035	CAD Supplies 13734 N IH 35 Austin, TX 78728	GovConnection
	Terms		2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	
	Delivery		2 days	1-3 days	1-2 days	
	*LOW BIDDER					

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Arc Global Documnt Mgmt.
 Archive Supplies Inc.
 CAD Supplies
 GovConnection
 Knight Office Solutions
 Matera Paper
 Mayfield Paper
 Office Depot

Office Resource Center
 Plotter Supplies
 Prints Charles Reprographics
 SA Lighthouse
 Staples
 Tavco
 Wide Format Co.

Demandstar
 SAWS Website